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How to Shade Pencil Drawings 

Understanding Light 

 

In your drawings, you will generally have one light source, which determines the location of highlights and the 
direction of shadows. The spot where the light hits your subject directly is called the highlight, and is usually 

pure white. The side facing away from the light source will be in shadow. The midtones refer to the gradation of 
tones between the shadow and the highlight. Most objects will also have an area of reflected light. This 
reflection happens when light hits the surface next to your object and bounces back. You will notice that these 

values blend into each other smoothly, which communicates to us the shape of the object. The only time you 
will see a hard edge is when there is a cast shadow, otherwise the tones change gradually. The closer the cast 

shadow is to the object, the darker it will be, fading as it moves farther away.  

 

 

 



Control Your Pencil 

The key to smooth shading is learning how to control your pencil. You need to be aware of how you hold the 

pencil, how you apply your strokes, and how hard you press. For darker shadows, press slightly harder and 
slowly lessen the pressure as you work away. Keep in mind that you shouldn’t have to press very hard; if you 
want darker shadows, build them with layers of graphite. Your pencil strokes sho uld be even and regular. You 

don’t want to be able to see the paper between your lines. Try to make your pencil strokes in the same direction 
to get smoother results. This is easier if you hold your pencil closer to the end and at an angle, using the side of 

the lead to shade. 

The wrong way! 

 

 

 

The right way! 

 

 



Blending 

Some people like the texture of the paper showing through, but I find you get the best shading results by 

blending. A blending stick is a small tube of tightly rolled paper that lets you smooth out pencil shading. You 
can use it the same way you use your pencil: on an angle with regular strokes. Again, yo u won’t need to press 
hard! Start at the lightest value and work towards the shadows. If your blending stick gets too dark, wipe it on a 

clean sheet of paper, or press it into your kneaded eraser. Learning how to shade well isn’t difficult, but it will 
take practice. With each drawing you’ll find yourself getting better. Remember, don’t be too timid with your 

shadows; a nice dark shadow will give your drawing depth. Let’s practice our new skills!  

How to Shade a Sphere 

A sphere is a good example because all of our elements are present: highlight, shadow, midtones, reflection, and 
cast shadow. To set up a maquette to draw from, get a ball and shine a table lamp toward it. This is a great way 

to train yourself to see the different elements of shading.  

First, draw the outline of your sphere and the shadow it casts. Outline the edges of your shadows and highlights. 
Draw the highlight a little bit bigger than what you want it to end up being. You will be blending into it and 

you’ll want to keep the highlight as white as possible.  

 

Using a medium pencil, like a B, very lightly shade the area around the highlight. Work your way to the edge of 

the sphere and the edge of the shadow. Squint to see the more subtle shading of this shape, and add another 
darker layer along the edge of the shadow. You don’t need to press any harder, just keep shading the same area 

until it gradually gets darker.  



 

Using a softer pencil, like a 2B, shade in the entire shadow area. You don’t want to be able to see the transition 
between the midtone and the shadow area, so try to make it gradual. Again, add another darker layer where you 
see the darkest shadows. 

 

Use your blending stick to blend your pencil marks together. It’s important to work from light to dark so your 

stick doesn’t get too dirty. If it does, wipe it on a piece of scrap paper or press it into your kneaded eraser. You 
want the white of the paper to show through as the brightest part of the highlight, so blend inwards, keeping the 
center free of graphite. 



 

The cast shadow directly under the sphere is the darkest value, so use an even softer pencil, like a 4B, to shade 
it. Switch back to your 2B to shade in the rest of the shadow. 

 

Blend out the cast shadow, paying close attention to the edges. The edges closest to the sphere are sharper, and 
get softer farther away. Lastly, use your kneaded eraser to clean up your edges and re-define your highlight and 

the reflection. Voila, a sphere! 



 

Now you can use your skills to realistically draw virtually anything with a rounded shape. The rules are the 
same! A highlight, a range of midtones, the shadow with a reflection, and a cast shadow!  

Happy drawing! 

 


